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Attachment 2 
 

 Gifts and Benefits Register – Quarter 1, 2021-22 (July to September 2021) Published 

Date given 
or received 

Description of gift 
or benefit 

Value Name of donor Name of 
recipient 

For gifts 
received was 
the gift: 

• retained by 
employee; 
or 

• retained by 
agency 

Reasons for accepting or giving 
(what is the benefit to the 
Queensland community) 

Name of 
accountable 
officer or 
supervisor 

Gifts given 

14/07/2021 

Britax Safe N Sound 
Maxi Guard Grey 
forward facing child 
restraint car seat 
suitable from 12 
mths to 8 years of 
age 

$369.00 
Consumer Products 
Safety Unit, Office of 
Fair Trading (OFT) 

Mike Saab n/a 

The gift was given as a completion 
prize for the Parents, Babies & 
Children's EXPO on 18 and 20 
June 2021. Attendees to the show 
scanned their tickets at the OFT 
Consumer Product Safety stand. 
The winner was selected through a 
random number generator process 
based on data collected at the 
show. 

David 

Mackie 

 

22/07/2021 

Donation to The 
Heart Foundation on 
behalf of the 
recipient 

$100.00 

Office of the Director 
of Public 
Prosecutions 
(ODPP) 

Debbie Jones n/a 

The gifted donation to the charity 
of the guest's choice was given in 
recognition for their participation 
and speaking at the 2021 ODPP 
Legal Conference. The gift assists 
in the provision of quality training 
by recognising the speaker and 
fosters professional working 
relationships. 

Phillip 

McCarthy QC 
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Date given 
or received 

Description of gift 
or benefit 

Value Name of donor Name of 
recipient 

For gifts 
received was 
the gift: 

• retained by 
employee; 
or 

• retained by 
agency 

Reasons for accepting or giving 
(what is the benefit to the 
Queensland community) 

Name of 
accountable 
officer or 
supervisor 

22/07/2021 
Donation to the 
RSPCA on behalf of 
the recipient 

$100.00 ODPP 
His Honour 
Judge Paul 
Smith 

n/a 

The gifted donation to the charity 
of the guest's choice was given in 
recognition for their participation 
and speaking at the 2021 ODPP 
Legal Conference. The gift assists 
in the provision of quality training 
by recognising the speaker and 
fosters professional working 
relationships. 

Phillip 

McCarthy QC 

22/07/2021 

Donation to The 
Hear and Say on 
behalf of the 
recipient 

$100.00 ODPP 
The Honourable 
Justice Bowskill 

n/a 

The gifted donation to the charity 
of the guest's choice was given in 
recognition for their participation 
and speaking at the 2021 ODPP 
Legal Conference. The gift assists 
in the provision of quality training 
by recognising the speaker and 
fosters professional working 
relationships. 

Phillip 

McCarthy QC 

27/07/2021 

Donation to The 
Survivors and Mates 
Support Network on 
behalf of the 
recipient 

$100.00 ODPP Dr Gary Foster n/a 

The gifted donation to the charity 
of the guest's choice was given in 
recognition for their participation 
and speaking at the 2021 ODPP 
Legal Conference. The gift assists 
in the provision of quality training 
by recognising the speaker and 
fosters professional working 
relationships. 

Phillip 

McCarthy QC 
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Date given 
or received 

Description of gift 
or benefit 

Value Name of donor Name of 
recipient 

For gifts 
received was 
the gift: 

• retained by 
employee; 
or 

• retained by 
agency 

Reasons for accepting or giving 
(what is the benefit to the 
Queensland community) 

Name of 
accountable 
officer or 
supervisor 

27/07/2021 

Donation to Rosies - 
Friends on the Street 
on behalf of the 
recipient 

$100.00 ODPP 

His Honour 
Chief Judge 
Brian 
Devereaux SC 

n/a 

The gifted donation to the charity 
of the guest's choice was given in 
recognition for their participation 
and speaking at the 2021 ODPP 
Legal Conference. The gift assists 
in the provision of quality training 
by recognising the speaker and 
fosters professional working 
relationships. 

Phillip 

McCarthy QC 

27/07/2021 

Donation to the Red 
Rose Foundation on 
behalf of the 
recipient 

$100.00 ODPP Kristy Smith n/a 

The gifted donation to the charity 
of the guest's choice was given in 
recognition for their participation 
and speaking at the 2021 ODPP 
Legal Conference. The gift assists 
in the provision of quality training 
by recognising the speaker and 
fosters professional working 
relationships. 

Phillip 

McCarthy QC 

Gifts received 

NIL 
reportable 

       

 


